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JNIOR END USER LICENSE AGREEMENT 
 

YOU SHOULD CAREFULLY READ THE FOLLOWING 
TERMS AND CONDITIONS BEFORE USING THIS 
PRODUCT.  IT CONTAINS SOFTWARE, THE USE OF 
WHICH IS LICENSED BY INTEG PROCESS GROUP, 
INC. (“INTEG PROCESS GROUP”), TO ITS 
CUSTOMERS FOR THEIR USE ONLY AS SET FORTH 
BELOW.  IF YOU DO NOT AGREE TO THE TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS OF THIS AGREEMENT, DO NOT 
USE THE SOFTWARE. USING ANY PART OF THE 
SOFTWARE INDICATES THAT YOU ACCEPT THESE 
TERMS. 
 
SOFTWARE 
 
Software includes the software pre-installed in the JNIOR 
product, the copy of the software, the associated media, and 
any printed materials. 
 
LICENSE 
 
INTEG process group grants you a nonexclusive license to 
use the Software only in the JNIOR product, subject to the 
terms and restrictions set forth in this License Agreement.  
You are not permitted to transfer or assign the Software or 
your rights under this License Agreement. You are not 
permitted to lease or rent, distribute or sublicense the 
Software or to use the Software in a time-sharing 
arrangement or in any other unauthorized manner.  Further, 
under this License Agreement, no license is granted to you in 
the human readable form of the Software (source code). You 
may obtain certain rights to the source code only by express 
written consent of INTEG process group and subject to terms 
and conditions acceptable to INTEG process group.  Except 
as provided below, this License Agreement does not grant 
you any rights to patents, copyrights, trade secrets, 
trademarks, or any other rights in respect to the Software. 
 
The Software is licensed to you to be used only with the 
JNIOR product.  You may not copy the Software except for 
back-up purposes.  
 
NO REVERSE ENGINEERING 
 
Modification, reverse engineering, reverse compiling, or 
disassembly of the Software and/or JNIOR hardware is 
expressly prohibited.   
 
EXPORT RESTRICTIONS 
 
You agree that you will not export or re-export the Software 
or any products utilizing the Software in violation of any 
applicable laws or regulations of the United States or the 
country in which you obtained them. 
 

TRADE SECRETS, TITLE 
 
You acknowledge and agree that the structure, sequence and 
organization of the Software are the valuable trade secrets of 
INTEG process group.  You agree to hold such trade secrets 
in confidence.  You further acknowledge and agree that 
ownership of, and title to, the Software and all subsequent 
copies thereof, regardless of the form or media are held by 
INTEG process group. 
 
UNITED STATES GOVERNMENT LEGEND 
 
The Software is commercial in nature and developed solely at 
private expense.  The Software is delivered as "Commercial 
Computer Software" as defined in DFARS 252.211-7015 or 
other applicable DFARS regulation or as a commercial item 
as defined in the applicable FAR of DFARS which ever is 
applicable and as such is provided with only such rights as 
are provided in this License Agreement, which is INTEG 
process group’s standard commercial license for the 
Software. Any use, modification, reproduction, release, 
performance, display or disclosure of the Software by the 
United States Government shall be governed solely by the 
terms of this Agreement and shall be prohibited except to the 
extent expressly permitted by the terms of this Agreement. 
 
TERMS AND TERMINATION 
 
This License Agreement is effective until terminated.  You 
may terminate it at any time by destroying the Software.  It 
will also terminate immediately if you fail to comply with 
any term or condition of this License Agreement.  Upon such 
termination you agree to destroy the Software. 
 
GOVERNING LAW 
 
This License Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania and by the laws of the 
United States, excluding their conflicts of laws principles. 
 
LIMITED WARRANTY; LIMITATION OF LIABILITY 
 
All warranties and limitations of liability applicable to the 
Software are as stated in the product manual accompanying 
the Software.  Such warranties and limitations of liability are 
incorporated herein in their entirety by this reference. 
 
ENTIRE AGREEMENT 
 
This License Agreement sets forth the entire understanding 
and agreement between you and INTEG process group, 
supersedes all prior agreements, whether written or oral, with 
respect to the Software, and may be amended only in a 
writing signed by both parties. 

 
   


